



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**_{sc}
LAW FIRM

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
TEL 608-255-8891

To: WISCONSIN CENTRAL GROUP
C/O WCG - STEERING COMMITTEE
DEWITT ROSS & STEVENS, S.C.
2 E. MIFFLIN STREET, SUITE 600
MADISON, WI 53703

Date: October 12, 2011
Invoice: 920791
Client: 71729.000

Re: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY

To Professional Services

		Rate	Hours	Amount
	John Duncan Varda			
09-01-11	NO CHARGE - Email exchanges with R. Luce regarding Northwoods Rail Coalition; research regarding same, checking contact information; accept engagement for 9/22/2011 at Rhinelander; consider further contacts, momentum	0	0.80	0.00
09-02-11	NO CHARGE - Multiple exchanges and follow-up regarding Northwoods Rail Coalition; conference call with B. Ridley regarding Walker/Ruest meeting, development of themes; further research regarding shippers and interests; exchanges with Wis. Dept. of Transportation regarding participation in meeting regarding "near term improvements in regulatory environment;" multiple exchanges with Messrs. Luce and Landeau regarding Northwoods Rail Coalition; review minutes and agenda of the Coalition, further searches regarding background	0	3.50	0.00
09-02-11	NO CHARGE - Respond to Wis. Department of Transportation invitation	0	0.30	0.00
09-04-11	NO CHARGE - Draft talking points for Waler-Ruest meeting	0	1.10	0.00
09-05-11	NO CHARGE - Adapt talking points for Wis. Dept. of Transportation meeting, preparation for Governor's Freight Summit	0	1.10	0.00
09-05-11	NO CHARGE - Forward to B. Ridley, draft talking points for Governer Walker-Ruest meting; review note from K. Korpi regarding value added manufacturing and export approach	0	0.50	0.00
09-06-11	NO CHARGE - Review report on timber blow-down, JSOnline; research DNR site and links including research on logger lists	0	1.00	0.00
09-06-11	NO CHARGE - Print out CFIRE study, "International Container Weight Limits," and talking points for Wis. Dept. of Transportation "Freight Reform Initiative" meeting	0	0.70	0.00



Date: October 12, 2011
Invoice: 920791
Client: 71729.000
Page: 2

Capitol Square Office
Two East Millin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
09-06-11	Attend Wis. Dept. of Transportation "Freight Reform Initiative" stakeholder meeting, preparation for Governor's Freight Summit, follow-up forwarding talking points to D. Vieth, Wis. Dept. of Transportation staff and advice memo to B. Ridley, J. Culotta and J. Landin (time prorated)	0	1.00	0.00
09-07-11	NO CHARGE - Further response, D. Vieth, Wis. Department of Transportation, regarding Freight Reform Initiative, opportunities for conversion to rail; forward to R. Adams et al; research regarding TOFC/COFC equipment for low volume terminals, note to L. Ogard regarding same; request to K. Korpi regarding informal survey of loggers and log truckers at Logging Congress, recovery of overpayment of road taxes for off-road and PTO operations; request follow-up on Stakeholder Network spread sheet; inquiry to NCWRPC regarding Medford Sub; email to R. Harding regarding Medford Sub group; exchanges with J. Coulotta and B. Ridley regarding CN, Wis. Department of Transportation and other contacts; review Wisconsin Central timetables, subdivision identifications	0	3.30	0.00
09-08-11	NO CHARGE - Email exchanges with J. Landin and J. Culotta regarding Wis. Dept. of Transportation frac sand white paper	0	0.20	0.00
09-08-11	NO CHARGE - Multiple exchanges regarding K. Soucie contacts, potential meeting	0	0.80	0.00
09-09-11	NO CHARGE - Exchanges with J. Culotta regarding meeting with K. Soucie, with B. Ridley regarding meeting with J. J. Ruest; meeting confirmation Northwoods Rail Coalition, D. Landeau	0	0.40	0.00
09-10-11	NO CHARGE - Consider strategy options; changing Steering Committee date	0	0.60	0.00
09-12-11	NO CHARGE - Exchanges regarding potential re-scheduling of Steering Committee meeting	0	0.20	0.00
09-13-11	NO CHARGE - Email exchanges regarding Medford Sub coalition	0	0.30	0.00
09-14-11	NO CHARGE - Email exchange with T. Klimek regarding conversion of 48-foot container well cars to log service	0	0.15	0.00
09-15-11	NO CHARGE - Email exchange with E. Burkhardt regarding conversion of well cars to log service	0	0.20	0.00
09-16-11	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference with T. Ciske, Fox Cities Chamber regarding K. Soucie contact, promise follow-up; exchange with J. Culotta regarding same	0	0.45	0.00
09-16-11	NO CHARGE - Further research potential conversion of well cars to log service; email T. Klimek regarding same	0	0.70	0.00
09-16-11	NO CHARGE - Further inquiry to T. Klimek, E&LS regarding 48 foot container well car question	0	0.45	0.00



Date: October 12, 2011
Invoice: 920791
Client: 71729.000
Page: 3

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
09-17-11	NO CHARGE - Draft further inquiry to T. Klimek on potential of converting 48-foot container well cars for log and biomass service	0	0.45	0.00
09-18-11	NO CHARGE - Response from T. Klimek regarding 48-foot container well cars, without modification, using modified containers	0	0.15	0.00
09-20-11	NO CHARGE - Fox Cities Chamber, T. Ciske: provide contacts list and suggested questions for meeting with K. Soucie	0	0.70	0.00
09-20-11	NO CHARGE - Inquiry to J. Culotta and J. Landin regarding Freight Rail Day	0	0.30	0.00
09-20-11	NO CHARGE - Preparation of presentation and printouts for Northwoods Rail Coalition; instructions on updating website; circulate to Blue Line and Fox Cities Chamber	0	2.20	0.00
09-21-11	NO CHARGE - Follow-up regarding Freight Rail Day, confirm meeting room reservation	0	0.40	0.00
09-21-11	Steering Committee: Complete agenda and forward	0	0.70	0.00
09-22-11	At Rhinelander, presentation to Northwoods Rail Coalition	0	2.00	0.00
09-22-11	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail Presentation, travel to/from Rhinelander	0	7.00	0.00
09-22-11	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference with Attorney R. Kuehn with Office of the Commissioner of Railroads, opportunity to connect with Governor Walker's team and information of Highway S Crossing for Wolf River	0	0.20	0.00
09-23-11	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail Coalition: Stakeholder Network invitations; follow-up on meeting presentation; research regarding Michigan Counties and other participation; email exchanges with J. Landru, R. Luce, J. Melchiori, Iron County, MI Economic Development; research multimodal loading site, Iron County, MI	0	1.50	0.00
09-23-11	NO CHARGE - Forward Steering Committee invitation to T. Henderson, Biewer Lumber	0	0.15	0.00
09-23-11	NO CHARGE - Exchanges with Wolf River and Green Bay Packaging follow-up on competition case studies	0	0.35	0.00
09-24-11	NO CHARGE - Draft outline, Review Wisconsin Central Group Game Plan/Options	0	1.25	0.00
09-25-11	Steering Committee: Update and reminder, forward "Review Wisconsin Central Group Game Plan/Options"	0	0.20	0.00
09-26-11	NO CHARGE - Arrange and un-arrange appointment with C. Kollman, Sadoff and Rudoy, discussion regarding improvement in CN service; telephone conference with Bob Schmit regarding failure of CN contact; multiple exchanges with T. Tisa regarding Schmit Trucking, phone number problem	0	0.50	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS^{SC}**
LAW FIRM

Date: October 12, 2011
 Invoice: 920791
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 4

Capitol Square Office
 Two East Mifflin Street
 Suite 600
 Madison, WI 53703-2865
 FAX 608-252-9243
 TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
09-27-11	NO CHARGE - Review A. Gould note regarding Steering Committee agenda problem, forward request to correct to assistant; follow-up	0	0.25	0.00
09-28-11	At Green Bay, discussion with Breakthrough Fuel regarding potential creating supply chain visibility for logs through management of fuel (time prorated)	0	0.35	0.00
09-29-11	NO CHARGE - Preparation for Steering Committee conference call; corrections and email to M. DePrey at Green Bay Packaging and C. Kollmann at Sadoff & Rudoy; pull language from Northwoods Rail Coalition minutes; travel to/from WMC headquarters	0	1.50	0.00
09-29-11	Participate in Steering Committee conference call	0	0.75	0.00
09-29-11	NO CHARGE - comments to B. Ridley regarding advisory board and related; inquiry to K. Sourcie regarding meeting; follow-up on Northwoods Rail Coalition, J. Bonovetz, Gogebic County, MI; review note from C. Kollman	0	0.80	0.00
09-30-11	Advice from B. Ridley regarding "Advisory Board"	0	0.10	0.00
Total Current Professional Services		0	39.55	0.00

Total Current Services and Disbursements	0.00
Balance Outstanding on this Matter as of 10-12-11	6,209.25
TOTAL DUE, PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT	6,209.25
RE: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY	

Trust Account Activity for this Invoice

Trust Account Balance as of 10-12-11	10,000.00
Application of Trust to Balance Due on Account	<u>0.00</u>
Balance Remaining in Trust as of 10-12-11	10,000.00